
Item # Qty Product Description
Amount per Unit Total Cost Amount per Unit Total Cost Amount per Unit Total Cost

1 100 1-Ton Cylinders Chlorine 463.00$         46,300.00$   446.00$         44,600.00$   No Bid -$                

2 60 150# Cylinders Chlorine 57.00$            3,420.00$      55.00$            3,300.00$      No Bid -$                

3 45 1-Ton Cylinders Sulfur Dioxide 585.00$         26,325.00$   1,030.00$      46,350.00$   No Bid -$                

4 16,000 gal. Fluoride H2SIF6 (BULK) 3.31$              52,960.00$   3.26$              52,160.00$   No Bid -$                

5 1,450 gal. 100% Polyphosphate 6.62$              9,599.00$      6.28$              9,106.00$      7.99$              11,585.50$   

6 9,000 gal. 70-30 Blend Orthoployphospate 5.77$              51,930.00$   6.24$              56,160.00$   7.87$              70,830.00$   

190,534.00$ 211,676.00$ 82,415.50$   

2-3 2-3 7

yes yes yes

# of Calendar Days to Delivery:

Bid Bond Submitted?

Bid Tabulation:  Water Treatment Chemicals (Purch 11-17)

DPC industries, Inc Hawkins, Inc Shannon Chemical

Total:


